
The Bogleheads Guide To The Three Fund
Portfolio
The Bogleheads have long been proponents of a simple and effective investment
strategy known as the Three Fund Portfolio. This approach advocates utilizing
just three funds to build a well-diversified and low-cost investment portfolio. In this
comprehensive guide, we will explore the principles behind the Three Fund
Portfolio, its benefits, and how you can implement it to achieve your financial
goals.

What is the Three Fund Portfolio?

The Three Fund Portfolio is a concept developed by members of the Bogleheads
community, inspired by the philosophy of renowned investor John C. Bogle. It
involves investing in three key asset classes: US Stocks, International Stocks,
and Bonds.

The portfolio is constructed by allocating a certain percentage of your investment
capital to each of these three funds. The recommended allocation typically
involves holding 60% in a US Total Stock Market Index Fund, 30% in an
International Stock Market Index Fund, and the remaining 10% in a Total Bond
Market Index Fund.
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The Principles Behind the Three Fund Portfolio

1. Simplicity: The Three Fund Portfolio adheres to the Bogleheads' philosophy of
simplicity in investing. Instead of picking individual stocks or attempting to time
the market, this strategy simplifies investment decisions by focusing on broad
market indexes.

2. Diversification: By investing across different asset classes, the Three Fund
Portfolio provides diversification benefits. This reduces the risk associated with
investing in a single company or sector, as gains in one asset class can help
offset losses in another.

3. Low-Cost: Bogleheads believe in minimizing investment costs. By investing in
low-cost index funds, such as those provided by Vanguard or other reputable
fund providers, you can avoid high expense ratios and unnecessary fees that eat
away at your returns over time.

Benefits of the Three Fund Portfolio

1. Easy to Implement: The Three Fund Portfolio is incredibly straightforward to set
up. With just three funds, you can create a well-diversified investment portfolio in
a matter of minutes. This accessibility makes it suitable for both novice and
experienced investors.
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2. Cost-Effective: By utilizing low-cost index funds, the Three Fund Portfolio
allows you to keep investment expenses to a minimum. This is particularly
important as high fees can significantly impact the long-term growth of your
portfolio.

3. Mitigates Risk: The Three Fund Portfolio's allocation across multiple asset
classes reduces your exposure to risk. If one segment of the market undergoes a
downturn, the others can potentially perform better, providing a buffer against
substantial losses.

4. Consistent Returns: While the Three Fund Portfolio may not deliver
astronomical returns, it aims to provide consistent, market-average returns over
the long term. This approach minimizes the chances of making emotional
investment decisions based on short-term market fluctuations.

Implementing the Three Fund Portfolio

When implementing the Three Fund Portfolio, it's essential to determine your risk
tolerance and investment goals. While the recommended allocation is 60% US
Stocks, 30% International Stocks, and 10% Bonds, you can adjust these
percentages based on your unique circumstances.

Research and select low-cost index funds that match the desired asset classes.
Vanguard, Fidelity, and Charles Schwab are popular providers known for their
low-cost index funds.

Once you've chosen the relevant funds, you can begin investing according to
your allocation. Regularly rebalance your portfolio to maintain the desired
percentage allocation, ensuring your investments align with your long-term goals.



The Bogleheads Guide to the Three Fund Portfolio offers a simple and effective
investment strategy for those seeking a time-tested approach to build wealth over
the long term. By combining the principles of simplicity, diversification, and cost-
effectiveness, this strategy has gained popularity among both amateur and
seasoned investors. Implementing the Three Fund Portfolio can provide a solid
foundation for your investment journey, allowing you to harness the power of the
market while minimizing unnecessary risks and fees. Remember, investing
should be a long-term endeavor, and the Three Fund Portfolio can serve as a
reliable companion for your financial success.
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Twenty benefits from the three-fund total market index portfolio. 

The Bogleheads’ Guide to The Three-Fund Portfolio describes the most popular
portfolio on the Bogleheads forum. This all-indexed portfolio contains over 15,000
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worldwide securities, in just three easily-managed funds, that has outperformed
the vast majority of both professional and amateur investors.

If you are a new investor, or an experienced investor who wants to simplify and
improve your portfolio, The Bogleheads’ Guide to The Three-Fund Portfolio is a
short, easy-to-read guide to show you how.
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