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The theatre world is often graced with performances that leave a lasting impact
on its audience. "Wise Children Oberon Modern Plays" is one such masterpiece
that captivates and mesmerizes from the first act to the grand . In this exclusive

http://epilogueepic.com/file/UlpFNnFHVDArbE03RGZpRm5HZ1ordDBBdjlacXdNSlVTT0tGV1JPUGE1NFE3c1FXalN3cmg5SUJ5YjdoYnpOcHQ1NDcyZkNKakxoYnpvWXM2NTM3RHJRKy9QemtBak1yUTJRa2ZOM3V4V0FkWFllUndXOUlSeHhyc3pMeEhQREI4STJHcWJnSDhWV3VsbUFZRFhkL0RGWUxYLzQ4SFNMY0s2TGxpTVVDaHVZPQ==:f4.pdf


review, we will dive deep into the magical world created by Emma Rice in her
adaptation of Angela Carter's novel.

Act 1: An Encounter with the Past

The play starts by introducing us to Nora and Dora Chance, the illegitimate twin
daughters of actor Melchior Hazard. Set in the early 20th century, it immediately
transports the audience back in time. The impeccable set designs, coupled with
stunning costumes, recreate the essence of this era. The energy and passion of
the performers are contagious, engulfing the viewers with excitement and
anticipation.
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Act 2: The Enigmatic Twins

As the play progresses, we witness the remarkable talent of the lead actresses
portraying Nora and Dora. Their chemistry on stage is electrifying, effortlessly
capturing the heart and soul of these complex characters. The power of their
voices and the precision of their movements create a spellbinding experience that
resonates with the audience long after the final bow.
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Act 3: A Symphony of Music and Dance

One cannot talk about "Wise Children Oberon Modern Plays" without mentioning
the extraordinary musical numbers. From classic jazz tunes to lively dance
routines, the production transports you to a bygone era filled with passion and
life. The carefully choreographed sequences leave the audience awestruck,
applauding with thunderous enthusiasm.

Act 4: A Tale of Love and Loss

The play delves into the complexities of family relationships, unrequited love, and
the bitter realities of life. Through clever dialogue and heartfelt performances, the
story touches upon the tangled web of emotions that define the human
experience. It provokes thought, evokes empathy, and leaves a lasting impact on
those lucky enough to witness it.

Act 5: An Unforgettable Experience

"Wise Children Oberon Modern Plays" is a theatrical journey that indulges the
senses and touches the heart. Emma Rice's adaptation impeccably captures the
essence of Angela Carter's novel, intertwining it with mesmerizing performances
and awe-inspiring musical sequences. From the visually stunning stage to the
emotional depth of the story, every element of this play is a testament to the
power of live theatre.

Experience the magic of "Wise Children Oberon Modern Plays" and let yourself
be swept away into a world of dreams, drama, and passion. Book your tickets
now for an unforgettable evening that will leave you spellbound.
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In Brixton, Nora and Dora Chance – twin chorus girls born and bred south of the
river – are celebrating their 75th birthday. Over the river in Chelsea, their father
and greatest actor of his generation Melchior Hazard turns 100 on the same day.
As does his twin brother Peregrine. If, in fact, he's still alive. And if, in truth,
Melchior is their real father after all…

Wise Children is adapted for the stage from Angela Carter's last novel about a
theatrical family living in South London. It centres around twin chorus girls, Nora
and Dora Chance, whose lives are brimming with mystery, illegitimacy  and
scandal. 

Dora narrates the story as her older self, looking back on a tumultuous life,
throughout which she and her sister have loved to sing and dance. A big, bawdy
tangle of theatrical joy and heartbreak, Wise Children is a celebration of show
business, family, forgiveness and hope. Expect show girls and Shakespeare, sex
and scandal, music, mischief and mistaken identity – and butterflies by the
thousand.
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